TEMPORARY SERVICES 2015-50

Performance Staffing

22nd Century Technologies Inc
Abacus Service Corp

HotFoot Recruiters

Administrative

Maintenance Worker

Assistant Specialist Equipment Operator Parks/Landfill Snow
With Healthcare ~ Without Healthcare ~ With Healthcare ~ Without Healthcare With Healthcare Without Healthcare With Healthcare ~ Without Healthcare ~ With Healthcare ~ Without Healthcare
12.65to 14.83 15.18 to 17.65 19.20 12.35to 14.65 13.50
No Bid 15.00 to 22.00 20.00 to 30.00 18.00 to 25.00 18.00 to 28.00 15.00 to 25.00 20.00 to 30.00 16.00 to 26.00 15.00 to 25.00 15.00 to 25.00
20.7 20.25 28.98 28.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid

35% Mark up with 1.5 times billing rate for overtime



